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”Assuredly, I say to you, whatever you bind on earth will be bound in heaven, 
and whatever you loose on earth will be loosed in heaven. “Again I say to you 
that if two of you agree on earth concerning anything that they ask, it will be 
done for them by My Father in heaven. For where two or three are gathered 
together in My name, I am there in the midst of them.” Matthew 18:18-20 
NKJV 
 
”How could one chase a thousand, And two put ten thousand to flight, Unless 
their Rock had sold them, And the Lord had surrendered them?” 
Deuteronomy 32:30 NKJV 
 
”If you abide in Me, and My words abide in you, you will ask what you desire, 
and it shall be done for you. By this My Father is glorified, that you bear much 
fruit; so you will be My disciples.” John 15:7-8 NKJV 
 
”So then faith comes by hearing, and hearing by the word of God.” 

NKJV 17:10 Romans  
 
”So faith comes from hearing, that is, hearing the Good News about Christ.“ 

NLT 17:10 Romans  
 
”You didn’t choose me. I chose you. I appointed you to go and produce lasting 
fruit, so that the Father will give you whatever you ask for, using my name.” 
John 15:16 NLT 
 
”At that time you won’t need to ask me for anything. I tell you the truth, you 
will ask the Father directly, and he will grant your request because you use my 
name. You haven’t done this before. Ask, using my name, and you will receive, 
and you will have abundant joy.” John 16:23-24 NLT 
 
Jesus really gave you power of attorney. That means what Jesus can do, we can 
do. 
 



”Now this is the confidence that we have in Him, that if we ask anything 
according to His will, He hears us. And if we know that He hears us, whatever 
we ask, we know that we have the petitions that we have asked of Him.” I 
John 5:14-15 NKJV 
 
”Since we have this confidence, we can also have great boldness before him, 
for if we ask anything agreeable to his will, he will hear us. And if we know 
that he hears us in whatever we ask, we also know that we have obtained the 
requests we ask of him.” 1 John 5:14-15 TPT 
 
”For God so loved the world that He gave His only begotten Son, that whoever 
believes in Him should not perish but have everlasting life.” John 3:16 NKJV 
 
”The Lord is not slack concerning His promise, as some count slackness, but is 
longsuffering toward us, not willing that any should perish but that all should 
come to repentance.” II Peter 3:9 NKJV 
 
”Who Himself bore our sins in His own body on the tree, that we, having died 
to sins, might live for righteousness—by whose stripes you were healed.” I 
Peter 2:24 NKJV 
 
”That it might be fulfilled which was spoken by Isaiah the prophet, saying: “He 
Himself took our infirmities And bore our sicknesses.” Matthew 8:17 NKJV 
 
”And my God shall supply all your need according to His riches in glory by 
Christ Jesus.” Philippians 4:19 NKJV 
 
”If you are willing and obedient, You shall eat the good of the land;” 

NKJV 19:1 Isaiah  
 
”If you then, being evil, know how to give good gifts to your children, how 
much more will your Father who is in heaven give good things to those who 
ask Him!” Matthew 7:11 NKJV 
 
”Therefore I say to you, whatever things you ask when you pray, believe that 
you receive them, and you will have them.” Mark 11:24 NKJV 
 
”So Jesus answered and said to them, Assuredly, I say to you, if you have faith 
and do not doubt, you will not only do what was done to the fig tree, but also if 



you say to this mountain, ‘Be removed and be cast into the sea,’ it will be done. 
And whatever things you ask in prayer, believing, you will receive.” Matthew 
21:21-22 NKJV 
 
”Jesus said to him, If you can believe, all things are possible to him who 
believes.” Mark 9:23 NKJV 
 


